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INDIAN INSTITUTE OF TECHNOLOGY KHARAGPUR
KHARAGPUR - 721 302, INDIA

REF NO: 2016/2023/0IR

To,
EdCIL (India) Limited

EdCIL House, Plot 18-A, Sector-16-A,
Noida-201301, Uttar Pradesh, India.

Date: 12.10.2023

Sub: Invoice for the Batch & Academic Year 2022-23 — Nepal Scholarship Student

Invoice — Third & Fourth Semester (Autumn & Spring, AY 2023-24)
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10/12/23, 4:47 PM Zimbra

Zimbra ir-office@adm.iitkgp.ac.in

Invoice for the Academic Year 2023-24 in respect of Nepal Scholarship Students of Batch 2020-
21, 2021-22 & 2022-23 (Old Batches)

From : KuldeepKumar Sandhu <kksandhu@edcil.co.in> Mon, Oct 09, 2023 02:50 PM

Subject : Invoice for the Academic Year 2023-24 in respect of Nepal
Scholarship Students of Batch 2020-21, 2021-22 & 2022-23 (Old
Batches)

To : deanor@adm.iitkgp.ac.in

Cc : rituparna@adm.iitkgp.ac.in, aruproy07@gmail.com,
adeanir@adm.iitkgp.ac.in, jracad@adm.iitkgp.ac.in,
gautamkumar@adm.iitkgp.ac.in, Amit Ahlawat
<aahlawat@edcil.co.in>

Dear Sir,
Refer to the trailing email to 11T, Kharagpur officials.

We are waiting for the invoice of Sumit Kumar Shah (MBA) of Nepal Scholarship Student sponsaored by
MEA.
The request was made in July and August 2023 but the invoice is not received by us.

The invoice is very urgent now. We have to claim the amount from MEA. On receipt of funds, the fee shall
be disburse to Institutes.

| have received the invoices from other NITs/lITs except your Institute and due to that | am not able to
claim the amount of more than 600 students from MEA.

Once again it is requested to provide the Invoice of Autumn & Spring for the academic year 2023-24 before
13/10/2023.

With Best Regards

Kuldeep Kumar Sandhu

Executive

EdCIL (India) Limited .

A Mini Ratna CPSE Under Government of India)
inistry of Education

ISO 9001:2015 & 14001:2015 Certified Company,

EdCIL House, Plot 18A, Sector 16A

Noida-201301, Uttar Pradesh, India

EPABX :+91-120-4156001-002

0120-4154003, 0120-2970206-07 & 08, Ext. 652

From: "KuldeepKumar Sandhu" <kksandhu@edcil.co.in>

To: aruproy07@gmail.com

Cc: rituparna@adm.iitkgp.ac.in

Sent: Monday, August 14, 2023 3:41:31 PM

Subject: Invoice for the Academic Year 2023-24 in respect of Nepal Scholarship Students of Batch 2020-
21, 2021-22 & 2022-23 (Old Batches)

Dear Sir/Madam,
Refer to the trailing email.
The invoice for the academic Year 2023-24 is not received by EdCIL.

Please send the same at the earliest for further process/claim of payment from MEA.

With Best Regards

Kuldeep Kumar Sandhu

Executive

EdCIL (India) Limited

(A Mini Ratna CPSE Under Government of India)
Ministry of Education

IS0 9001:2015 & 14001:2015 Certified Company,
EdCIL House, Plot 18A, Sector 16A
Noida-201301, Uttar Pradesh, India

EPABX :+91-120-4156001-002,
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