~ Indian Institute of Technology Khara%pur - S
> Administrative Approval For Procurement (FORM - A)

Booklng Request ID:FBR/2022-2023/IT/16712 Booking ID:FBK/2022-2023/1IT/15950

Name of Indentor : Shruti Singh Parihar (16066)

Designation ) : Executive Officer

Organisation : Indian Institute of Technology Kharagpur

Cost Center : International Relations

Project - Not Applicable

Budget Information : Maintenance Fund
: Being amount paid to Blugent Hospitality-V/2022/641 towards fooding expenses of international

Item Description delegates from Technical University of Munich and other associates. vide bill no-325 dt 16-09-
2022

Total Estimated Value : 13781.00 [ Rupees Thirteen Thousand Seven Hundred Eighty One Only ] /-

Status : Approved

Justification(add extra sheet if required )

summarized position of allocation

IstalAllocated Cumulative Boked Available Balance Total Concurred Creation Information
Amount Fund
1284518.00 762875.00 521643.00 712212.00 16066
‘ : : T 127-01-2023 06:25 PM
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Date: I/’ R i
(S|gnature of The Indentor})
Shruti Singh Parihar
Executive Officer
Emp. Code: 16066
If Proposal upto 600000 /- ; Approved
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Approved
If Proposal above 600000 /-
Recomendation of the /ALL DEANS OTHER THAN DEAN(SRIC)HoD / HoC / HoS / DEAN
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(Signature with Seal)

Approved
Deputy Director
Date:, (Director)
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TAX INVOICE

, Office:Sumangala Complex
vapur Road,Bolsar,Opp. Hotel Blue Diamond

Site Office:New Technology Guest House
IIT Kharagpur,West Bengal

lNo.BIB 325 \
Blugent Hospitality Pvt. Ltd.

.Aumbal,Maharastra- 401501 ' ph|nl;7g'_1‘3zc)2 7
Guest Namie ooy eeneranisrianes Room N vginsvenans ff. {L ..... .
Book by../ Dean, OHCAA... Date:../.6. /Q’/&m .......................
DEPLanniiiiiiii e Rt DEtE. . s omiapsng e snmss s
Sl.No. Particular Quantity | Rate Amount
1 | BREAK FAST
2 | LUNCH (VEG.)
| 3 | LUNCH (NVEG.)
4 | DINNER (VEG.)
5 | DINNER (N/VEG)
6 | SEMI SPECIAL (LUNCH / mmgmga-%aa} 2.0 Joeft £aUU A0
7 | SPECIAL (LUNCH / BINNER) //42- 7« A2 ) !5 LFESH FLRS 90
8 |TEA i \
9 | COFFEE \
10 | DRINKING WATER (BOTTLED) \
11 | OTHERS \
12
13 ;
14 :
15 —
16 TOTAL /313500
| et | 5 %| 696200
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IGSTIN : 27AAKCB3556H1Z1 7
SAC Code : 996332 ?W,NW | Cé%éi;l—_—
Pan No. AAKCBS%Q}I iy
Vendor Code : S’O o For Blugent Hospitality Pvt. Ltd.

\VV2022/641:

Original Message
From: New Guest House <nghghijli.il
To: Sadhan <sadhan@hijli.iitkgp.ac.in>
Cc: Dean Outreach <deanor@adm.iitkgp.ac.
<anirban. b;m' ’d‘inup" i;ﬁ'kgﬂ'v ac.in>,
tgh <tgh@hi Ll

Sent: Mon
Subject: Re:

E«\U) erpe”

Lunch booking

Dear Sir,

tkgp.ac.

alolika mukherjee <alol

in>

in», anirban biswas

12 f\;n 2822 16:53:01 +0530 (IST)

/confirming

ronment.

ika.mukherjee@adm, iitkgp.ac.in>,
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.ed rice is added on menu and this is final Rate:-475/+GST \\

-- Original Message -----

com: "New Guest House" <ngh@hijli.iitkgp.ac.in>
To: "Sadhan" <sadhan@hijli.iitkgp.ac.in>
Cc: "Dean Qutreach" <deanor@adm.iitkgp.ac.in>, "anirban biswas”
<anirban.biswas@adm.iitkgp.ac.in>, "alolika mukherjee"
<alolika.mukherjee@adm. iitkgp.ac.in», "tgh" <tghghijli.iitkgp.ernet.in>
Sent: Tuesday, September 13, 2022 5:53:11 PM
Subject: Re: Lunch booking

Dear Sadan Da Due teo lack of manpower this week, not able to provide this time
kindly accept

14.09.22 (LUNCH) FOR 28Pax
REGULAR MENU (N/VEG)

Chilli Paneer

SORSE VETKI

BUTTER CHICKEN

RASMALAI

Ice Cream

Pan at the rate of Rs.45@/ Thanking you for understanding/accepting/confirming
this menu

————— Original Message -----

From: "Sadhan" <sadhan@hijli.iitkgp.ac.in>

To: "New Guest House" <nghghijli.iitkgp.ac.in>

Cc: "Dean Qutreach" <deanor@adm.iitkgp.ac.in>, "anirban biswas"
<anirban.biswas@adm.iitkgp.ac.in>, "alolika mukherjee"
<alolika.mukherjee@adm. iitkgp.ac.in>, "tgh" <tgh@hijli.iitkgp.ernet.in>
Sent: Tuesday, September 13, 2022 7:36:82 AM

Subject: Re: Lunch booking

Dear Amar/Sakti,
Please go ahead with the menu.
Best Regards

Sadhan Banerjee

Office of Alumni Affairs & Branding
Indian Institute of Technology Kharagpur
Kharagpur 721302

Ph: +91 3222 281677

Please don't print this e-mail unless you really need to. Save Paper, Save Environment.

————— Original Message -----

From: New Guest House <ngh@hijli.iitkgp.ac.in>

To: Sadhan <sadhan@hijli.iitkgp.ac.ins

Cc: Dean Qutreach <deanor@adm.iitkgp.ac.in>, anirban biswas

<anirban.biswas@adm, iitkgp.ac.in>, alolika mukherjee <alolika.mukherjee@adm.iitkgp.ac.in>,
tgh <tghhijli.iitkgp.ernet.in>

Sent: Mon, 12 Sep 2822 16:53:01 +0530 (IST)

Subject: Re: Lunch booking

Dear Sir,




